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Greetings from Sundance. 

We have a collection of movies with Indian actors. Not 
Bollywood – more like Arapahollywood. (Patience, please, 
while I weave this back together.) Several years ago we 
watched a movie called Christmas in the Clouds (silly but 
entertaining) because it featured Indian actors Sheila 
Tousey and Graham Greene. The movie was filmed entirely 
at Sundance Resort (yes, Robert Redford) and we decided 
we had to go there someday. Today is someday.

Our cabin sits here in the Wasatch Range among bigtooth 
maple, gambel oak, quaking aspen and a mixture of 
mountain conifers. It has a noisy creek behind it and a little 
deck for drinking coffee. 



The chairs are hard, both on the deck and in the rooms, in 
order to get you out and paying for extra activities like golf, 
or tennis, or yoga, or “bringing your mind, body and spirit 
into perfect balance in a softly-lit, natural wood spa”.

As intended, we were propelled out of our cabin by the 
chairs, but avoided the money traps by using one of the 
hiking trails accessible to guests. We headed for Stewart 
Falls which cascades down from some melting icepack. 
Everything around us was soaking wet from last night’s rain 
and soon we were too, at least from the ankles down. 
Luckily the sun was making its chance appearance for the 
day, playing peek-a-boo behind low lying clouds.







We got back in time for the next round of rain and lunch 
from the deli. We had chicken with chipotle aioli on ciabatta 
on hard chairs. The chicken was on the ciabatta, we were 
on the chairs.
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